




WATCH OUT, IT’S EVERYWHERE by Patrick G. Lee 

Of all the stories I reported on this summer, this one on poison ivy involved the most 
collaboration and, I think, represented the best of what teamwork can help produce. The 
initial idea for the story came from a lot of anecdotal evidence floating around the 
newsroom -- various editors and reporters remarking that they thought poison ivy was 
striking back with particular force this season. Then, my editor saw a brief, half-page 
online blurb about a local little league team that had been affected by poison ivy after 
the oils got rubbed on a baseball they had used during a practice, and after passing the 
article off to me, he asked me to investigate whether there was a real trend to report on. 
 
There was, but it took a lot of legwork and good old fashioned gumshoe reporting for 
me to dig through all the layers. I became an immediate expert on the state of Boston's 
poison ivy situation, calling up poison ivy "exterminators," experts at the UMass 
agricultural extension, pharmacists at area drugstores, company executives in the 
poison ivy ointment industry, hospital emergency rooms and dermatologists. But I never 
would have constructed as comprehensive a web of knowledge as quickly as I did were 
it not for the guidance of everyone around me in the newsroom, who gave me sourcing 
suggestions or put me in touch with their spouses or friends or doctors as possible 
leads. 
 
The mix of informal and formal sourcing and qualitative and quantitative data that I 
collected composed an intimidating body of research by the week's end, but weaving it 
all together and condensing the story down to its essential core was an exciting 
challenge. In this case, it paid off many times over -- not only because the story got 
great play in the paper itself, but also because I felt it was one of my stories with the 
most direct meaning and impact for readers. One of the aims that has driven my work 
as a health journalist is that of doing readers a public service, and hopefully revealing 
new things about the world in which they live. Poison ivy, though it may seem like a 
mundane topic, was one avenue through which I was able to accomplish that aim as a 
Kaiser intern this past summer. 
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